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Introduction  

The Integrated Coastal Resources Management in Pulau Langkawi (ICRM-PL), Malaysia was 
implemented under a collaborative project framework between SEAFDEC through the Training 
Department (SEAFDEC/TD) and Department of Fisheries (DOF) Malaysia starting in August 2003 
after successful implementation of the project in Pathew District, Chumphon Province, Thailand then 
known as the Locally Based Fisheries Management (LCBRM-PD). 

The Malaysian project site which is located in a fishing village in Kuala Teriang, Pulau Langkawi, 
had previously carried out CBRM-related activities through the formation of a Fishermen Economic 
Group or KEN since 2001 emphasizing more on economic activities. KEN was later renamed in 2007 
as the Fisheries Resources Management Community (KPSP) in line with the activities that give more 
focus on responsible fisheries management and with greater emphasis on ecosystem and 
environmental aspects. 

Under the collaborative involvement of SEAFDEC/TD, many scheduled programs and activities were 
carried out with the assistance and participation from various agencies mainly by the DOF Malaysia. 
Among the activities and programs initiated and carried out were: Fishing Gear Technology, 
Biological Survey, Statistics, Outboard Engine Repairs Workshop, Fiberglass Fishing Boat Repair 
and Maintenance, Simple Book-Keeping Methodologies, Installation of FEDs and Working Visits to 
project sites in Thailand. One of the activities which interest the KPSP was the Crab Bank project 
after a study tour for the then KEN members in Kuala Teriang to the ICRM Project site in Pathew 
District, Chumphon Province, Thailand conducted in April 2005. 

Background of Crab Bank System 

THAILAND 

The initiative of preserving natural crab resources, which has been declining over the years, was 
initiated at the ICRM-PD project in Pathew District, Chumphon Province, Thailand since year 2002. 
The necessary steps involved restocking the gravid crabs caught by the fishermen in spawning cages. 
This project was initiated under the supervision of an NGO, the Thai Environmental Institute and 
subsequently handed over to the collaborative project ICRM-PD of SEAFDEC and DOF Thailand in 
August 2003. Since the main fishing gear being operated was the collapsible crab trap, further studies 
and steps were taken to reduce the juvenile crabs being caught by enlarging the mesh size of the trap 
bottom from 1.2 to 2.5 inches so that the smaller ones could escape while the trap is being hauled. 
Hence the catch data collected from year 2002 to 2006 showed an increase in catch landings and 
marked crabs sighted, also the carapace length of female and male crabs caught varied (Table 4). 

Table 4. Record of swimming crab catch in Pathew District, Chumphon Province, Thailand 
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A practical workshop was organized on Crab Bank System for the crab fishers by SEAFDEC/TD and 
DOF Malaysia on 13 June 2007. Attended by 23 participants, the Workshop aimed to disseminate the 
concept, procedures, methodologies and recording in logbooks as well as the appropriate way to 
release the crabs back to the sea. Hence, the Crab Bank Sub-group was organized and a signboard to 
promote the activities was made by SEAFDEC/TD. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Objectives  

The Crab Bank system was introduced to the FRMC (KPSP) Kuala Teriang, Langkawi for the Crab 
Trap and Gill Net Fishers in order to achieve and fulfill the following objectives: 

i. To introduce to the crab fishers (stakeholders) the voluntary scheme of releasing gravid crabs 
caught alive back to the sea after marking the carapace; 

ii. To assist in preserving and sustaining the crab resources as well as minimizing their extinction 
by taking necessary steps on resource utilization at an optimum level; 

iii. To encourage and impart awareness to the fishing communities and the public regarding the 
steps taken to conserve, protect and rehabilitate the crab resources; 

iv. To promote teamwork, cooperation and responsibilities towards the importance of crab resources 
conservation to fishing industry in Malaysia; and 

v. To recognize the FRMC (KPSP) as the front liner and initiator of the management and 
conservation of crab resources to the fishing communities and industries. 

During the workshop, the Crab Fishers’ agreed to abide by the conditions on recording the number of 
every gravid crab caught in a logbook provided to each member. Follow up and counterchecking 
would be done by the District Fisheries Extension Officer. A token as form of incentive, was 
promised to the participants recording the highest catch and release by the end of December 2007. 

Tools and Materials  

The crab trap and gill net fishers of FRMC (KPSP) Kuala Teriang are the participating members and 
the necessary materials needed included a special marker pen, log book to record the catches, a towel 
to clean the carapace, and possibly a camera to record while marking and releasing the gravid crabs. 
In December 2007, the logbooks were inspected and it was observed that only three (3) participants 
could provide the necessary figures (Table 6). 

Table 6. Number of crabs released by KPSP Kuala Teriang 

PERIOD PARTICIPANT QUANTITY (pcs) FROM 4.6.08 - 15.9.08 (pcs) 
From 0.06.2007 
To 03.06.2008 

No.1 140 (30) 
No.2 63 (25) 
No. 3 30 (20) 

Total 3 233 (75) 
 
  

Marking the crab carapace (left) and training on logbook entry (right) 
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